
unspeakable courage to expose such a
difficult time in one’s life to a reading
audience. This is the act of a physician
and father determined to teach the
reader how schizophrenia affects both
the sufferer and his or her family.

After I read these excerpts from Dr.
Louden’s diary, I knew immediately to
whom I would recommend this book.
This is a book for those who doubt the
impact of mental illness, both on the

sufferer and his or her family. This is a
book that can educate the reader about
the myths surrounding mental illness
and about the stigma that still exists re-
garding mental illness and especially
schizophrenia.

This book forces the reader to re-
flect on his or her own views of mental
illness and the dignity that can be lost
when one suffers from a mental illness.
Mary Louden’s own reflection and re-

membrance demand this from the
reader. As I read this account of a sis-
ter’s reunion in spirit, I found myself
reflecting on some of my patients and
their families. Relative stranger: a life
after death has heightened my aware-
ness of the impact of mental illness.

Gail Beck
Psychiatrist
Ottawa, Ont.
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The Left Atrium

Room for a view

The Family Room

Adjacent to every intensive care
unit, operating room and
emergency department is ar-

guably the most important room in
the hospital — the Family Room. This
is where the normally parallel emo-
tional lives of patients and physicians
intersect, where feelings and vulnera-
bilities are exposed, and where physi-
cians make permanent impressions
on family members.

Family Rooms are usually small,
furnished with couches or comfort-
able, soft sofas, presumably to provide
the physical comforts meant to offset
the tremendous emotional burden of
the unknown fate of a loved one. I have
always been impressed by the efforts
that some hospitals have made to
make these rooms as pretty as possi-
ble. I have seen leather couches, potted
plants, paintings on the wall, even tele-
visions. Despite this, these are terrible
rooms for families; they are in reality
furnished not with sofas and various
comforts, but with nerves, tension and
raw emotion.

As a medical student, I have on oc-
casion been witness to various families’
most terrible moments, being told of
the death of a loved one, that a daugh-
ter is brain dead, that a brother is para-
lyzed. The Family Room is more than a
room; it is the health care system’s
equivalent of holy ground: a space

where all are equal, where treatment is
determined, and where decisions are
made to sustain life, or to end it. It is
the moral centre of the hospital.

I have learned things in the Family
Room about breaking bad news. These
are lessons borne not out of simula-
tions or interactions with actors por-
traying patients, but out of difficult
experiences with real patients and real
emotions. I have learned that it is dis-
astrous to sugar coat bad news and to
dance around the truth. Families over-
whelmingly want to know as much as
possible; they are starved for infor-
mation and will repeatedly thank
the physician even after having been
told devastating news. The strength
of these families will never cease to
amaze me.

I have learned that, in order to make
something clear, it should be repeated
several times, even if it is difficult to
hear, or say.

I have learned that the moment bad
news is broken, everything changes in
those few seconds and a family is
ripped apart. For most individuals this
will be a defining moment of their
lives, when someone dear to them has
been lost, or irrevocably altered.

I have learned to be careful when
choosing my words, because families
will hang on to everything a physician
says. They will begin their sentences

from here on with “the doctor said …”
and “the doctor thinks … .”

I have learned that things that may
seem obvious to outsiders can remain
beyond comprehension if not wit-
nessed first-hand. Yes, the loss of a
child will be terrible, and yes it will be
hard to see, but it is equally hard to lis-
ten to a mother lament that she will
not, that she cannot, bury her child.

I have learned that the walk out of
the Family Room is just as difficult as
the walk toward it.

No matter how big or small the space
or how gaudy the paintings on the wall,
the Family Room is where the physi-
cian’s role is best exemplified. I have
learned that breaking bad news does not
get easier, that it is always difficult and
that no matter how hard someone might
try, the Family Room will never be pretty.

Nir Lipsman
Medical student
Kingston, Ont.D

O
I:

10
.1

50
3/

cm
aj

.0
61

26
8

iS
to

ck
ph

ot
o




