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Use physician-rating websites 
with caution

I congratulate Paul Webster for his reflec-
tive article on “physician-rating websites” 
in CMAJ, which I absolutely support.1 For 
online ratings, a fair amount of skepticism 
is always better than blind trust. Consumer 
organizations in Germany recommend 
noncommercial, cost-free and ad-free por-
tals, such as the Weisse Liste (https://
weisse-liste.de/de/), when looking for a 
suitable doctor. Therein, for example, the 
results are based on a scientifically devel-
oped survey, and there is no ranking of the 
supposedly “best” doctors. Commercial 
physician-rating websites that rely on 
advertising need to offer something to 
their financial backers and that may affect 
the findings.

Liu and colleagues have just published 
the nature and trends of online physician 

ratings in Canada in the Journal of Medical 
Internet Research.2 With regard to specialty 
and geographic practice location, the study 
is certainly interesting for CMAJ readers.
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